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(Contract Managentent Use only)
CONTRACT APPROVAL FORM
20 ! 2 0 ' CONTRACT
WL DEC E‘ ﬁH Ri Y505 TRACKING NO.
CONTRACTOR INFORMATION 2 _— ,\.ﬂ)
Croi G -U
Name: _Ricoh Americas Corp -through CopyFax, Inc
Address: P.Q. Box 41602, Philadelphia , PA 19101-1602 6631 N Executive Pk Court, Suite 210 Jacksonville, E1.32216 :
e '
Contractor’s Administrator Name:___ Richard Durrant Title:_ Education & Government Sales Manager .
]
Tel#: 904-296-1600 Ext 2413 Fax: 904-296-7111 Email: richarddurrant@copyfax.com -
CONTRACT INFORMATION
Contract Name: _Lease agreement for Ricoh Color Copier MPCG65G1 Contract Value; $14,505.12 [)

Brief Description: 36 month lease agreement for Ricoh Color Copier MPC6501 at $402.92 per month, University of

South Florida bid #9-13-G. Replacing leased Ricoh MP7001 black & white copier & owned Savin 2408 Color Copier (unable to get

repair parts for the Savin)

Contract Dates : From: _1/1/13 to _12/31/16 Status; X New  Renew _ Amend# _ WA/Task Order

How Procured: _ Sole Source  Single Source  ITB ~ RFP  RFQ__ Coop. ___ Other Piggyback Contract

If Processing an Amendment:
Contract #: Increase Amount of Existing Contract: No Increase

New Contract Dates: to TOTAL OR AMENDMENT AMOUNT:

APPRO\? PURSUANT TO NASSAU COUNTY PURCHASING POLICY, SECTEON 6

/ﬁ’ /«—-’-V”'/ /OA’/ 2 Charges based on usage
re / " Date Funding Source/Acct #
: 45246515-544000

1. Robert McKinney
Department Head if

2 S0~V 45245524-544000
_ 45249515-544000
Ofﬁce of e’: & Budget Date
4, / //’\ (2 -2 - Z
CountyAdfomey (approved as to form only) Date
Comments:
[ ' B
COUNTY MANAGER - FINAL SIGNATURE APPROVAL oo :
L]
e f}//)f’/f?/ i
Ted Selby - Date '
RETURN ORIGINAL(S) TO CONTRACT MANAGEMENT FOR DISTRIBUTION AS FOLLOWS: i
Original: Clerk’s Services; Contractor (original or certified copy) - ‘
Copy: Department § J

Office of Management & Budget
Contract Management
Clerk Finance

Revised 972472012




NASSAU COUNTY

VENDOR NAME/ADDRESS BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS pace| 1 | of[ 1 |
PO Box 4000 \
Ricoh Americas Corporation FERNANDINA BEACH, FLORIDA 32035-4000 U DEPARTMENT ) -
C/0 Copyfax Inc. Buliding }7}{)
6631 N. Executive Park Ct REQUISITION Diane Griffin
Jacksonville, Florida 32216 REQUISIFION BY:
VENDOR NUMBER | PURCHASE ORDER NUMBER |- PURCHASE ORDER DATE-! |1 """ PURCHASE ORDER TOTAL =" | ' - 'DISCOUNT TERMS -
10/9/2012 $14,505.12
NO.| e ESCRIETION “lnmy | oprice | AMOUNT. ol v FUND AGCOUNT NUMBER
1 {36 Month Lease agreement with 36 | 402,92 | $14,505.12 {Payment allocations based on usage
Copyfax for Ricoh MP6501 Color Allocations from 1/1/13 thru 9/30/13
Copler with SR4030 finisher stapler . 45246515-544000 - $1,350.00
45245524-544000 - $750.00
Current lease will remain in effect 45249515-544000 - $1,526.00
until 12/31/12
Per Richard Durrant of Copyfax For 2012/2013 reducing purchase order to

encumber yearly charges

University of South Flgrida

Contract -1%/ o ~l'?)"‘c;‘“ P
/

Allocation charges based on

monthly usage,

o P o

Approved By

o
/; [P

APPROVED BY: WHITE - FINANCES COPY 1 Subtotal
YELLOW - REQUISITIONER'S COPY [« Total $14,505.12




OCTOBER 2, 2012

PROPOSAL
FOR
NASSAU COUNTY
BUILDING DEPARTMENT

RICOH MP6501 COLOR COPIER $367.97
SR4030 FINISHER-STAPLER 34.95
LEASE OPTIONS
36 MONTHS @ $402.92 PER MONTII
UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA #9-13-G

e
36 MONTH LEAST,

MAINTENANCE AND SUPPLY AGREEMENT

TO INCLUDE ALL PARTS, LABOR, SERVICE CALLS AND
SUPPLIES EXCEPT PAPER AND STAPLES AT $.0055 PER
BLACK AND WHITE PRINT AND $.045 PER. COLOR PRINT.

Jacksonville e Gainesville ¢« S5t. Augustine &« Daytona Beach <«
6631 N Executive Park Court 3210 5W 40th Blvd. 140 Gateway Clrcle 480 Fentrass Blvd

Suite 210 Sulta A2 Suite 1 Suite 1.

Jacksonville, FL 32216 Galnesville, FL 32608 St. Johns, FL 32259 Daytona Beach, FL 32114
Phone: 904.296.1600 Phone: 352.336,1771 Phone; 204.827.0178 Phone: 386.252.2292

Fax:904.296.7111 Fax:352,336.8151 Fax: 904.208.5105 Fax: 386,252.0920
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Schedule B te
Ricoh Masler Pricing Agrocment -
Torma & Condlbonz to reforance Rleoh Master Pricing Agroanont,
Effactive:
232012
Coplas Ricoh ] Savin ! Lanior Febq2 Cantract Fuv Flv FMY BNV Rlest Alltncluslve PG
Prints Lquipment Rleoh Savin Lanlar KON foang loase Laasa Laasa Service Plan
Developments  |and Options Reorder Raardar Raordar VPN Retall Purchage | 24 Monthly | 2¢Monthly | 4 Menialy | $2NManthly Sorvico Monthly Manitly  Santhiy & Anwat Flans
Far Minule Prices Per Unit Number Mumber Numhor Number Prics Price Peyrocnia Payments Paymonts Payments Leval Date ¥ Alawanco Cxcluto Supplias
Beaklot Flnioker SRAT10 4tago? 416007 416007 18007 5310 4525 7445 4020 T IR a.a7 1 £.00 9 s0.q000
Punch Unkt Kit U300 32 Hote 412855 4U2BEE 412088 412095 s 252 27 700 048] o44 Q o0 0
1 tiin Tray BN3100™ 415808 415006 415000 A15000 580 2z 1028 23 522 440 o s [
Hay Guuntor Bracket Typo H 41252 412552 412082 412552 105 E 23 144 118 100 o tg 0
Optlohnl Celter Intustaas Unlt Typa A Alamz A3z 3012 Az ] 3 150 093 070 0.04 o 4] o
Plaian Gaver Typa 2002 415000 415000 415000 415000 540 45 218 106 1.4t 033 o g o $0.0000
Card Roadar Sracket Typo I 416014 415614 416314 415614 100 -] 301 1,87 153 128 $0.0000
ADF Handlo Typo © 418213 418213 410213 peleob) 200 k] 345 230 184 104
Cuglar Tablg Typa B 413611 415011 415671 45011 270 108 514 a1n 20t 220
Erwakipa Foetiar ERA020 410272 416272 Pilieed 418272 2408 108 520 328 288 278 o 800 9
Fax Cptlons: ° o
Pax Option Type Go602~ 415591 410001 415991 410001 1,400 a2 1040 .00 aar [ [ o6 o
%3 intartace Ul Type Sod0L 415000 415000 413050 415308 oo 204 £ 614 L1 424 [ 008 9]
B Mamory 4000RUSAE " otz o134zl o1 342MIL QoA 205 5 12 a7 Q62 Q52 [ 008 ¢
Fax Connactlon Unit Typa 5 41002 at0022 Filed 410022 290 18 583 340 5 250
Point / Gean Options: [ a
JEEERAZ.140/5 Wirnlons Typa 4 414008 414008 444000 414508 Ba3 2 1411 B 748 o4 0 o0 !l
IEEE, 1284 Interlaco Typs A At00e 41099 413808 411689 0 a8 23 144 146 1.00 [ .00 9
Qgatit Cthormet Type & 454204 AlAz04 41404 414304 <3 i 140 ka4 w7 4m o 0.00 [
Comera Dircat Print Gard Typo J 410000 410000 10006 416008 e 26 126 08 0.04 .04 o 0.00 [
Paatncript3 Unk Type 5802 15008 415080 418008 415860 [ 20 1423 oo k] 808 [ 082 [
Flia Format Gonvartar Typa & 414007 414007 14007 414007 oz 3w 1455 1) T3 i) o 0% 0
50 curd for NofWara prining Type H 416001 416001 416001 410001 20 kg a7 232 100 180
Drowsar Unkk Typa F 416002 410002 16002 418002 179 s 316 196 1.08 133
Bluotesth Intasface Ualkt Typa B #5010 #15818 #5618 45818 Q20 e 125 006 571 402
Adcitionas Cptlong: o b
Duda Grarwtlla Soourlly Unil Typa H 410073 419373 416373 46373 5o 167 ao &z 454 421 2 am 0
Gopy Dt Soourly Unlt Typo & Ao 416381 Ao 41030 80 350 18,39 12145 1045 058 o .00 0
Seguenca Gompose A04RT A0da7 44337 4047 1,200 To00 7.3 =48 1928 1816 - <] 0
EFI SaaQuonce Impese 404336 05T 404330 40430 2200 1,002 kips! a2 W4 mzn| [ .00 9
Golor Frafilar v3 wi£31000 UV 0C5HETIIY COMITMIL 0050970 OREDETMIL 3,600 1871 BG4 soaz 005 184 & ] 0
GP vZ10 3 Upgrado ' ) QUZEEBNMIL 480 320 15.62 03 7.68 0,04 o .00 o
54000 Caler Spacirephotometar coutaMIL opatismL ooat oML asatsoMu 1,240 bril 5 2348 1920 042 [ oo o]
Galar Prafier vd SW Gnly U ' qa57aOMIY 1,000 1400 S7AT 3507 2046 2440 o a8 o
Spet-0n 43317 4337 437 43317 1,200 519 2400 1532 128 057 0 ace 4
Auts Tropging 413010 43O 13m0 413318 1200 a0 2460 1532 1253 1057 [ 000 &
E5t Hot Foldam A28 41345 s A3 1260 ] 2468 1532 1253 1057 [ [:E o
H10 Tablo for E31000 QUSTIGMIY 0OSTIOMIU QUSTTEMILS 00STFOMIU 2,290 1708 52,54 St 4203 35.48 o iy [
] [
65 B&W [ 80 Color |Rlcoh MP CHE01/Savin C8065/Lanier LDSGIC 415182 415182 415182 MPCES0T 330,855 $12.225 359251 367,97 \n $300,80 $252.19 1 50 Supplles Includod 30.0049 Black/ $0.0450 Golor!
75 BAW /70 Color |Rlcch MP £7504/Savin 9078/ Lanier LOSYSC 415189 415163 413183 MPC7601 $47,040] slaazet $507.00 537110 530342 $2565.05 z 56050 25,000 $0.0048 Black/ $0.04560 Color;
ESP XG-PCS-200 S0B42EMIU QUEAZOMIY osRIMY CUBAZEMIL 8 133 [+£5 400 232 2m 2 500,20 56,000 30.0040 Black 1 $0.0450 Color|
ESP Diglta) QC 200420 PowarFier ORELOnIL frlsdiislelt ] 0a206oMIL ES24ZNT 200 o2 440 Flerd 220 11 4 $129.00 €0,000 $0.0040 Black £ $0.0450 Color
Natwork & Scan Connoeot « Sog BG4 PG-NWGCDCS | FS-NWSCEC4 | PS-NWSCDC4 | PS-NWSEDC4 425 105 06.06 276 .00 2,40 5 $150.50 74,000 40,0040 Black f $0.0450 Color
Network G Soan Cosnaet - Sag BCE PS P PG P i 500 28 4.8 a8 08 206
Copy Tray Typa 2073 . 412100 42100 12100 12100 180 kol £ 294 175 147 o 000 o
RT4ILCT Dundly ) J 2428 1,005 4874 2025 2473 2086 Q 2,00 [ 0.0000) |
SR4Q30 Flnlohar{.000 sheat finlshor—G0-ahaet single)™ 414857 4357 444057 Av4057 2000 1161 bl ugE™  mar 2440 o .00 0
SRA04D Finlohor (2600 shoat Halskar—saddl atlick)™ 414050 414090 414950 414050 5775 1745 8483 S252 4204 2023 o .00 - 30.0000
SR3090 Rinlshar 12001 412401 212081 412081 8122 2734 122,00 8229 orzs 5078 & 00 ¢
Finishur Adaglor Typa & 442073 413073 A19073 413075 0 m 826 £ 4T 7 o .00 o $g.0000
HMIKIT Troy Ualt Typa 2103 411230 411396 411298 411500 1,800 42 ot ) 2] 1028 1640 ] aq0 0 300000
LCIT RT4000 443005 215005 413009 . 413805 3010 2513 121,88 T8.84 0184 - 8237 o .00 o 30,0000
Puneh Unlt Typo 3200 41200 412208 Nz 432008 505 =07 1052 3] 334 450 ] 0.00 a
PUGO0D Punch Unlt 412083 412085 412003 412083 205 sz 2047 1270 1030 876 bl a0 a
Caver intorposar Tray Typn 3260 412213 412212 412213 412213 1218 502 728 1692 1383 11,07 0 000 [
Tat chaot Helder Type 3200 A1 412203 412203 412203 8 ] 118 f:hed 059 050 o Cle] <
BUXXI4 Tray Typa 1075 AT07 4187 411187 414487 805 418 el ] 240 1616 il 0 020 Q
Sutput Joggar Unit Type 3200 diziz azz 422 aamz 200 80 873 Saz 443 ars o 0.08 H
TIG000 Cover Intarponar 4125978 412070 A12078 42078 3,864 4,708 BBTT 53.85 4405 3744 0 [E:0) 0| $0.0000
Vil Folding Unit Type FOS000 4haten An41E3 A3 04183 2600 4783 258 13183 BT 48,00 0 a0 b
£ BinMall Do G531 44zgt atmet et 42101 2205 a2 2020 1042 1402 1250 o it o
Flio Format Corwartar Typo £ 414007 414007 414007 414007 02 200 1425 o 730 am [ 000 9
Ring Bindor RBIA00 04112 404192 404112 404112 20,000 12004 01420 wan ) 2100 20200 a 000 [ $0.0000
Copy Sonnaolar Type 2260 #2416 4418 412416 212415 1505 fo- %20 21.88 1709 1503 [ 00 0
Typo 1037 Kay Gountor Drackat 412537 412537 Rlhlvig 412557 105 @ 194 120 008 003 8 o0 Q
Optianol Couhtar Interfaca Unlk Type A a1z 413012 10012 412012 @ a1 150 .31 a7e 004 o o 9
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INVITATICN TC NEGOTIATE NUMBER: 9-~13-G

Award To:

BID TITLE:"

Printers

Coepiers,

3 UNIVERSITY OF
.88 SOUTH FLORIDA

BIDS e

Printers and Multi-Functional

\ Lot:

Bell Techlogix, Inc. - Lot I
Dell Marketing L.P. Lot I
Konica Minolta Business Lot 'II

. Inc.

Sciutions U.3.A.,

Ricoh Americas Corporation

Kerox

Corporatioﬁ

Lots T & II




[N PROROSAL TABULATION
N TiTLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functional Printers
IN NUMBER: 9-13-G

PENING CATE: May 22. 2009

TIME __3:00 B.M,

FATLURE TO EILE A PROTEST WITHIN TEE TIME SRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3),
FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHER SECURLITY REQUIRED™
BY 1AW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE B TRIVER
OF PROCEEDTHGS UNDER CHBEIER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS
ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TO THE STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY
AND ALL ADDITICNAL TERMS AND CONDITICNS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROPUSERS ARE
REJECTED AND SEALL HAVE MO FORCE AND EFFECT. OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED
HEREIN ARE THE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY A$ OF THE APOVE OPENING DATE ANMD

TIME. ALL OTHER OFFERS SUBMIZTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS SOLICITATION, IF m, ARE
HERERY REJECTED AS LATE.

WARDEDDATE__ Oev M, 2099 NOWLCE O BID/PROFOSALS PROTEST BONDING, REQUIREVENT- ANY DERSON WEO FILES AN
ACTION PROTESTING A DECISION OR INTENRDED DECISION PERTAINING TG 3 SOLICITATION
OSTING TIMEDATE SEALL AT TEE TIME OF FILING OF THED FORMAL PROTEST, POST WITH THE UNIVSRSITY A
F \ P j ,{:% jﬁm BEND FAYAELE TO THE DNIVERSITY OF SQUTH FLORIDA IN AN AMOUNT EQURL TO: 10
ROM "™ / e? PERCENT QF 'THE ESTIMATED.VALUE OF THE PROTESTCR'S BID QR PROPOSART: 10 PERCENT .
OF THE ESTIMATED EXPENDITORE. DURING< THE CONTRACT TERM: $10,00Q0; QR WHICHEVER
$ LESS. THE BOND S B ITIONED UF YMENT OF ALL TS WHICH MAY
UNTIL: 2“ it f f@/)} Gr}/j £9 gE mgtsrnsgnﬁamnsn:ﬁ%% cguggigwcrt Hgimggﬁg}%R33EST ACTION. Iz%OiIISlU oé A
: BOND, THE UNIVERSITY MAY ACCEPT A CASHEIER'S CHECK OR MONEY QRDER IN THE AMOUNT
Lg ’ OF THE BOND. FRTILURE TCO SILE THR PROPER BORD 2D THE TIME OF 'E‘II.ING THE FORMAL
PAGE: / QF PA'GE(S) PROTEST, SHALT RESUIQ IN A DENTAL OF THE PROTEST.
‘ - e e . oo .
DESCRIPTION/VENDORS Tos . ?7 C %5 A& .
- %mwg Techalogix Mar%:a%anﬁﬁ 2SEES e | Comnecion
ITN COVER SIGNED = @ Ne  § ISP MO YES TR NOS § (TESY | wo T NO
RDDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED | (TESD| No {¢9ESH| wo | (T80 o [GES | wo | WES. IO
ADDENDUM NO. 2 SIGNED |{’ ’YEE) NG ( @ NO CYE?D T wo l{ @ - (@ES o
EEO SIGNED G5 yo L yEssl wo § &@sO| owo YES? No |SZESTY e
W9 SIGNED TE8) | cmo (@TESS  wo JCyms? | wo vo [(JED wo
MINORITY.VENDOR @ : ' em C‘: '
. N R ES NO YES YES NO
ENTERPRISE RESEONSE ($44) | Ny (= :) 5O DA HO
1y e AP S WM
0 . \ . :
PROPOSAL CONTENT @ | wo D wo {{wESy| wo- [Cyms )| wo [KCyEs®| o
# PROPOSAL COPIES | aticnnat Bagaieq lorgiod Yeapes)! otiaied Jascies .Q{’Eqmm.j‘ Y popies | oriciegl A eoois
NO BID YES |. NO ) YES NO |- YES NO YES - NO YES " NO
. , 1; LT & LT b
DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) : 1 g
- s — o n e )
PENED BY:__Mark Lillguist TABULATED BY;_| pza.0 2 f\w}é@ VERIFIED BY: ——

EMARKS:  CIRCLED PRfCE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD,

REV.8/7{2008




NTITLE: Copiers, Prinfers and Mutti-Functional Printers.

N NUMBER: 9-13-G

FARILURE TC FILE A PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME PRESCKISED 1N SECTIUN

120.57 (3} , FLCRIDA STATUTREZ, OR FAILURE TC POST THE BCND OR OIHER
SECURITY REQUIRED BY LEW WITHIN THE TIME ALLOWED FOR FILING A BOND
SHALL CONSTITUTE A WAIVER OF FROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIPA

. . STATUTES. ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY THE STXTE ARE SUBJECT TO THE
PEN}NG DATE Ma\f 22' 2099 TIME 300 P'M' STATE'S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL, ADDITIONAL TERMS AND
CORDIYIONS SUBMIWTED BY TEE BIDDERS/PROPOSERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL EAVE
NO FORCE 2ND EFFECT. QFEFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED EEREIN ARE THE ONLY
WARDED DATE OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND TIME. ALY OTEER
. OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO WHIS SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY
OSTING TIME/DATE RECECTED &S LATE. ‘
FROM: | NOUWECE'OF BID/PROPOSALS PROTEST BONDING REOUTREMENT- ANY PERSON WEC FILES
AN BCTION PROTESTING & BECISICN OR INTENDED DECISION PERTAINING TC A
SOLICTTATION SHALL AT THE TIME OF FILING OF ‘THE FCORMAT PROTEST, POST
UNTR: WITE THE UNIVERSITY 2 BOKD PAYASLE TO THE UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA IN
AN AMOUNT EQUAL T0: 10 PERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED VALUE OF THE .
2 - s S 6 moniy; 4 Sockr & e s
PAGE: PAGE(S) BF GONDERIONED DBGN THE BAYMENT OF ALL GOSTS YHICH MAY #E ADJUDEED
. AGRINST THE CONTRACTOR FILING THE PROTEST ACTION. IN LIEC OF A BOND, TEE
UNIVERSITY MAY ACCEPT A CASHIER'S CHECK ORMONEY ORDER IM THE AMOUNT OF
THE POND. FRATLURE TO FEILE TIE TROPER BOND AT TimLTDdE OF FILING THE FORMAMTL,
FROTEST, SHATY RESULY IN 3 DENIAL OF 'EE!I‘. FPROTESYT.
™ o Py ! ) : . _ - -
DESCRIPTION/VENDORS C@"‘fﬁ'@“‘ ;ﬁ%ﬁ:ﬁa aess| PCMall Gy, |West Coast }G?{@ e :Q} o
_ . Siplebons | Copies, Croghics )

TEN COVER SIGNED GESY | no | @ED | wo s | (W0 | GER) | w § @ED ‘ NO
ADDENDUM NO: 1 SIGNED &EEN|  No ¥ESY | wo |€¥Ess| wo . | (¥ES) | wo {ymsd| wo
ADDENCUM NO. 2 SIGNED ves | (WO | @S | wo ves | (N0 ((TEE) | wo | ®EED| wo |

EEQ SIGNED YES) { NO RS NO YES ( i3 of? L {yES) No f (¥ES? NO %
W9 SIGNED Cyzsr | wo | (@8O wo vESSy | . x0  |CEES?| wo . {(¥EED! wo |
MINORITY VENDOR ¥ES NO By | wo | ves | Qo |<¥E)| wo | & wo S‘
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE (#44] | &S c\_) w2
i : _ —
PROPOSAL CONTENT TES o | &ED| wo |&ED| wo | GES | wo [ EED | 3§
¥ PROPOSAL COPIES { o dlengies |14 Copies, |1+ eopies | |+ coples || FY copies §
NO BID YES | O YES NO YES NO V&g NO. YES | - NO .
— . ; ‘ LOTL v
' DISQUALTFIED (REASON/S)
PENED BY:__Mark Lillquist s

EMARKS:  CIRCLED PRICE INDICATES INTENT TO AWARD,

TABULATED BY: L0100 —wbif 08 VERIFED BY:

REV.8/7/2008




N TITLE: Copiers, Printers and Multi-Functionat Printers

N NUMBER: 9-13-G

FAILURE TC FILE B PROTEST WITHIN THE TIME FRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(3},
FLORIDA STATUTES, OR FAILURE TO POST THE BOND OR OTHER SECORITY REQUIRED
BY LW WITHIN THE TIME ALLGWED FOR FILING B BOND SHALL CONSTITUIE 2
WALVER OF PROCEEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES. ILL
BIDSYPROFOSALS ACCEFTED BY THE STATE ARE SUBJECT TCQ THEE STATE'S TERMS AND

. . CONDITIONS AND ANY AWD ALL ADDITIONAL IERM COND SUBMITT Y THE
PENING DATE' May 22' 2009 TIME 3'{}0 P’M’ BIDDERSJ"PROPO@ERS ARE REJECTEDIII.;ND SHALT. HSE.VI‘;NJIDQO FORi%IgES]; EE‘FECT.EDOEB‘FE.gS
' FROM THE VENDORS LISTED EEREIN ARE THE ONLY, OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE
J ABOVE OFENING DATE AND TIME. ALL OTEER OFFERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS
WARDED DATE SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HERESY RECECTED AS LATE.’
DETING TIMEMATE NOTICH OF BID/PROPOSALS. PROTEST BONDING REQUIREMENT- ANY PERSON WHO FILES AN
. ACTION PROTESTING A DECESION OR INTENDED DECISION PERTATINING TO B
FROM - [ SOLICITATION SEALL. AT THE TIME OF FILING OF THE FORMAL PROTEST, POST WITH
THE UNIVERSITY A BOND PAYARLE TQO THEE UNIVERSITY OF SOUTH FLORIDA IN AN
< . AMOUNT EQUAL TO: 10 PERCENT OF 'THE ESTIMATED VALUE OF THE PROTESTCRS BID.
UNTIL: ) OR PROPOSAL: 10 PERCENT OF THE ESTTMATED ZXPENDITURE DURING THE CONTRACT
A TERM: $10,000: .OR WHICHEVIR IS TRSZ. THE DOND SHATIL BE CONDITIONED U2ON THE .
mf é)'_i‘ PAYMENT OQF ALL COSTS WHICH MAY BE ADJUDRGED AGAINST THE CONTRACECOR FILING.
. ) E TEZ PROTRST ACTION. IN LIEU OF A BOND, THE UNIVERSITY MaY ACCEPT A
PAGE' OF PAGE(S) CASHIER'S CHECK OR MONEY ORDER IN THEE AMCOCUNT OF THE BOND. FAILURE 0 FILE
N THE‘EROPEB BOND A!E THE TTME OF FILIHNG TE_E_ FORMAL PROTREST, SHALD RESULS TN A
DENTAT . OF" R PROTEST. . :
i ] .
DESCRIPTION/VENDORS >0 Koniea | TELH [leat OFQea | Shugtidag .
ok bAoA, L DERT Cohons | Teaisdlosd Giop
ITN COVER SIGNED ES | we | GEES| wo } No | FEE . wo | gESTH wo
ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED IoNo P @EES| wo YES | vs ((Cno) | &ES | N
ADDENDUM NO, 2 SIGNED YES Eeo I wo vEs | (Fo) | vms | (@ | @& | wo
: =
EEC SIGNED | @& wo | @& wo [GEs wo | GESD| v | GED | wo
W9 SIGNED Ne . f (YESS | wo NO &es >l wo |CEEED! wo
. o ' T, o AT e
MIRORITY VENDOR YES xo [.(¥EEY | wo VES wo | {¥Es 3 wo YES NO
ENTERPRISE RESEONSE (#44) i s ~ e ]
PROPOSAL CONTENT xo | FEEE) | wo T (¥EDD| o YES xo [xEe)| wo
# PROPOSBL COPIES .  ||oriq+ Heacpies |/ + 4 copes |1+ VCapd | [ 4 copies | [ +4 eopies
NO BID YES NO ‘YES NO YES NG YES | NO | YES NO
o LoT
DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S} . :
' oo St —
PENED BY:__ Mark Lillquist TABULATED BY:_LGAG{R. sty VERIFIED BY; '

EMARKS:  CIRCLED PRICEINDICATES INTENT TO AWARD.

REV.8{7/2008




™ PROPGS ALT ABULATION : o ‘ FATLURE 70 FILE A PROTEST WITHEIN THE TIME BRESCRIBED IN SECTION 120.57(33,

FLORIDA STAIUTES, OR FRILURE TO POST THE BOND ‘OR OTHER SECURITY REQUIRED

. . . . . ' BY LaW WITEIN THE TIME ALIOWED- FOR FILING A BOND SHALL CONSTITUTE A VAIVER ~
IN TITLE: Copiers. Printers and Mulfi-Functignal Printers OF PROCHEDINGS UNDER CHAPTER 120, FLORIDA STATUTES, ALL BIDS/PROPOSALS

. ACCEPTED BY THE STATE ARE SUSJECT TC THE STATE(S TERMS AND CONDITIONS AND ANY
TN NUMBER: 8-13-G AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITTONS SUBMITTED BY THE BIDDERS/PROFOSERS ARE

‘ N . . . REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO PCRCE AND EFFECT. (OFFERS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED

. } . - HEREIN ARE TEE ONLY OFFERS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE ABOVE OPENING DATE AND
JPENING DATE; May 22; 2009 T.IME 3:00 P.M. . TIME. ALL OTHER OFPERS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE 7C THIS SOLICITATICN, IF ANY, ARE
HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE.

WARDED DATE NOTZICE OF BID/PROPOSALS FROTEST BONDING REQUIREMENT- ANY PERSON WEO FILES BN
‘ . . S * ACTION PROTESTING & DECIGION OX INTENDED DECLSTOR BEETATNING TO 2 SOLICITATION.
IGSTING TIME/DATE . - ’ : SHALL AT TEE TIME OF FILING OF THE FORMAL PROTEST, POST WETE THE. UNIVERSITY 3
FROM: ' / ) EOND PAYRBLE TO THE UNTVERSITY OF SOUPH FLORIDA IN AN AMODNT EQUAL TO: 10

BERCENT OF THE ESTIMATED VALUE OF THE PROTESTOR’S BID OR PRCFOSAL: 10 PERCENT -
OF THE ESTIMATED EXNPENDITURE DURING THE CONTRACT TERM: 510,000: OR WHICHEVER

. - - IS5 LESS. THE BOND SHALL BE eONDITIONED UBON IBE PAYMENT QF ALL COSTS, WHICE MAY
UNTIE: ! . o BE EDSUDGED AGATNST THE CONTRACTOR FILTNG THE PROTEST ACTION. IN LIEU OF B
BOND, THE UNIVERSITY MAY BCCEPT B CRSHTER'S CHECE OR MONEY ORDER IN THE AMODNT

to L 7 . . OF PHE BOND. FAILURE T FILE THE PROFER BOND AT THE TIME OF FILING THE FORMBL

PAGE: 3 ' OF m{‘ PAGE(S) . PROTEST, SHALT RESULY TN _A_‘ng QF THE PROTEST.
DESCRIPTION/VENDORS ‘g(@?gﬁ},{

,ITN COVER SIGNED xg | vEs | o YES NO | ¥BS |. NO | YES NO
ADDENDUM NO. 1 SIGNED | (¥ES>) | . WO || vus No | Y®s' | xo YES. | No | YES | NO
ADDENDUM KO. 2 sTGNED || (¥ES>| wo |} ¥Es | wo vES NO .| YES O | YES | WO

EEC SIGNED HES>| wo, | ¥es NO YES | WO YES | NO [ YES NO
W9 SIGNED 4 &S | NG {. YES NO YES NO YES NO vES NO
MINORITY, VENDOR | 5| wo | ves NO YES NO  YES o | ¥ES | ‘w0
ENTERPRISE RESPONSE {(#44) ’ ¥ ‘ - _
PROPOSAL CONTENT || (SEs- | | w '  yp
No | YES NO YES NO YES NO YES NO
¥ PROPOSAL COPIES || | - Lfpopes § :
NO BID YES | . NO- [ YES NO YES | NO |- YES NO YES NO
. LoTE i |
DISQUALIFIED (REASON/S) .
BRI T
OPENED BY:_ Mark Liliguist TABULATED BY C"’-«Z_ﬁ (63 s ”"“’} VERIFIED BY:

REMARKS:  CIRCLED PRICE IND!CATES INTENTTQ AWARD
: REV.8/7/2008
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Proven Productivity

Staying competitive means doing more work in
less time with accuracy and reliability. Trust the
Ricoh Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP to provide
exactly what demanding users need.

o Reduce turnaround time with fast output. The MP C6501SP delivers 60
color and 65 black & white pages per minute and the MP C7501SP
achieves speeds up to 70 color and 75 black & white pages per minute,
Bath offer duplexing at 100% of rated speed.

s Accelerate productivity with one-pass duplex scanning. This not only
reduces scan time, it minimizes wear and tear on sensitive originals.

o Navigate {o the features you need In just a few quick selections.

The large full-color WVGA control panel is the same intuitive LCD
touch-screen available on all Ricoh MFPs, so you can upgrade the
fleet without retraining users.

» Meet tight deadlines and complete quick-turn jobs with one of the
shortest warm-up times and fastest first copy times of any high-speed
color device in its class.

s Optimize efficdency with the ability to reload paper without interrupting
the current job. Total paper capacity with all options is an incredible
7,400 sheets.

High-End Finishing

Extend the possibilities of document production
with a variety of paper handling accessories and
professional-grade finishing options.

« Expariment with new formats. The Multi-Fold Unit offers six folding
options, including Half-Fold, Double Parallel Fold and Gate-Fold.

o Create full-color output on a wide range of paper grades. The system
accepts up to 140 Ib. Index (253 g/m?) thraugh the Paper Trays and up
to 110 Ib. Cover (300 g/m?) through the Bypass Tray.

s Improve uptime with the optional Large Capacity Tray. This 2,000-
sheet accessory holds paper sizes up to 12% x 18" and weights up
to 110 Ib. Cover (300 g/m?).

e Distribute high-quality finished dacuments with stapling, hole punching,
ring binding or saddle-stitching, depending on your neads.

Reduce Operating Costs

In addition to its best-in-class affordability,
the Ricoh Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP delivers
the speed and versatility organizations need
to keep operating expenses low.

» Perform a wide variety of color and finishing tasks in-house, eliminating
the need to outsource complex jobs to expensive third-party providers.

» Consolidate jobs from multiple laser or inkjet printers to cut supply costs.

o Print marketing colfateral, forms, training packets and other documents
on demand instead of managing large volurnes of preprinted inventory.

o Empower creative teams to produce high-guality layouts, proofs and
mock-ups with exceptional speed and quality.

o Improve workflow in copy shops and print-for-pay environments by
adding high-quality color capacity and finishing capabilities that are
ideal for quick-turn jobs.
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Scan both sides of any original without feeding
it twice using single-pass duplex scanning.

Create a variety of full-color documents with
different folding options.

Castle View

EmergiCure

Choose the Ring Bind Unit to create ready-
to-distrioute training packets, reports and
other lengthy documents.,




Enhance Performance and

Quality While Reducing Cost

Optional Cover Interposers
Feed pre-printed sheets frem one or
two sources for front and back covers,

——— . [ :!Erriu '

Optional 3,000-Sheet Finishers
Choose from 50- or 100-sheet stapling
and 2- or 3-hole punching.

Optional 2,000-Sheet Baoklet Finisher
Fold and staple full-color documents to produce
firished booklets and 2- or 3-hole punching.

50-Sheet Finisher
This finisher fets you select multi-position
stapling for documents up to 50 pages.

Optional FDS000 Multi-Fold Unit
Execute several different folds to create
a variety of finished documents.

Optional RBS000 Ring Bind Unit
Punch holes and insert plastic rings to
produce ready-to-distripute books.

BK5010e Booklet Maker
Saddle stitch up to 30 sheets to create
120-page booklets.

GBC StreamPunch™ Il
Create professional-quality bound boaks with
in-line punching in a variety of patterns.

Versatile Paper Sources

Standard paper sources include the Tandem 2 x 1,100-Sheet Paper Tray,

two 550-Sheet Paper Trays and Bypass Tray for a total of 3,400 sheets,

With additional options also shown here, this system can hold up to 7,400 sheats.




Impressive Image Quality
The high-powered color print engine in the Ricoh
Aficio MP C65015P/C7501SP creates high-resolution
images that capture your customers’ attention.

+ Maximize edge definition, coverage consistency and color density with
breakthrough PxP oil-free taner from Ricoh, Smaller particles and a lower
melting point combine to create smooth blends and solid fills.

o Help visually impalred users with a spedial printer driver function that adjusts
color levels to enhance readability.

.. Expect vivid, intense colors with a powerful 1200
@) p'tl mize Color O Utput dpi print engine and new PxP oil-free toner.
Configure the Ricoh Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP with
the Fiery E-7200 print controller for professional-
grade print and color control.

= Boost onboard power and expedite complex processing tasks with a
2.0GHz precessor.

s Get all the advantages of Fiery color manipulation without giving up
familiar Ricoh functionality for other tasks. Even if you choose the optional
Fiery controller, you can keep user-friendly Ricoh menus for a full host
of scanning capabilities.

o Streamline workflow with convenient drag-and-drop functionality,
Just point and click to move files from the desktop to a print
queue, prepare files for output or halarce workflow among multiple
connected devices,

s Maximize job-to-job efficency with the Command WorkStation
utility. Switch effortlessly from managing jobs to configuring the
controllers settings.

o Bridge the gap between platforms. The Flery controller provides
identical functionality in both Windows and Mac environments.

Expedite full-color job processing with the
incredibly fast, Ef Fery £-7200 print controfter,

Enhance Personal Productivity

The App2Me® solution revolutionizes document
management, enabling users to create customized
workflows and execute them anywhere they go.

» Download widgets to any client {desktop PC, laptop or Smartphone) and
use them on any Ricoh MFP enabled with App2Me.

s Enjoy maximum convenience and a consistent experience at each App2Me-
enabled MFP, which is completely personalized no matter where you go.

» Simplify complex workflows, Widgets can be created to combine,
distribute, edit and create documents, as well as perform many other
tasks automatically.

o Maximize productivity. App2Me improves efficiency thraugh widgets
that control a virtually endless array of MFF, software or Web service-
driven workflows.

o Create specialized widgets for almost any need, in any framework
across multiple platforms that App2Me supports, such as Google Deskiop™
and more.

With App2Me, you can download time-saving
and workflow-enhancing widgets and use
them at any Ricoh MFP enabled with the
App2Me solution.




Multifunction Performance
The Ricoh Aficio MP C6501SP/C7501SP
integrates a diverse range of capabilities
into a relatively small footprint, enabling
you to reach new heights of productivity
and efficiency.

e Manage virtually any document-related task with this
incredibly versatite, high-speed system. Choose from
advanced printing, copying, faxing and scanning functions.

» Reduce network traffic with high-compression PDFs,
especially when hanrdling large full-color files.

Proteci Every Gy
Document (a .
Advanced security features =
ensure that sensitive documents
and the system itself remain
safe from multiple threats.

e Restrict system access to authorized users.
The system supports external (Windows, LDAP)
and internal (basic and user code) authentication.
° Protect business critical information with the
DataOverwriteSecurity System {DOSS}) option.
it automatically overwrites the hard drive after
copy, scan, fax and print jobs, You can also use
the HDD Encryption option to protect data, even
if the hard drive is removed or stolen.

Environmential Advantages
Many organizations are “going green” by
setting goals for sustainability. The Ricoh
Aficio MP C6501SP/C75015P helps support
these efforts.
» Minimize total energy consumption. The Ricoh Aficio
MP C6501SP/C7501SP uses significantly less electricity
without compromising speed, productivity or functionality.
It is also designed 1o use less energy during sleep mode,
¢ Maintain outstanding image quality. With its lower melting
point, PxP toner requires less energy, yet delivers the high-
quality results you expect.

The Total
Green Office

Solution
Ricoh continues its long-standing
commitment to developing office
solutions with environmentally
friendly and superior energy- and
supply-saving features, without
compromising productivity.




General Specifications

Configuration Console

Scanning Element Patbed with moving 3-ine CCD
array image-scanning

System Memory 320GB {160GE x 2) (Shared)

Standard 150-Sheet ADF with
single-pass color duplex scanning
500 dpi

256 Levels

1-9993

Sheet/Book/Object

Upto 117 x 17"

MP C65015P: <70 sec.

MP C75015F; <60 sec,

MP C6501SP: 5.7/7.5 sec. (BWAQ)
MP C75015P: 4.9/6.4 sec. (BWIFC)
NP CE5015P: 60/65 (FC/ABW)

MP C7501SP; 70/75 (FCRW
1stTray 1,100 % 2

550 sheets x 2nd & 3rd trays,
100-5heet Bypass Tray

3,400 standard

7,400 sheet std, max capadty
55" x 85710127 x 18"

14 [b. Bond - 84 [b, Cover (216 o/m?}
(Tray 1, 2)

14 Ih, Bond - 140 . Index {253 g/m?)
(Tray 3)

17 fb. Bond ~ 80 1, Indax {163 g/m?
(Cuplex

14 b, Bond - 110 fo. Cover (300 g/mY)
(Bypass}

7 reduction and 5 epfargement
255 to 400% in 1% increments
MP C65015F: 120-127v/20A/60H2

Docuntent Feeder

Copy Resolution
Color/Grayscale
Quantity Indicator
Original Type
Criginal Size
Warm-Up Tima

First Copy Speed
Output Speed

Standard Paper Capacity

Paper Size
Paper Weight

Magnification
Zoom
Power Requirements

MP C75015F: 208-240V/20A/60Hz
Dimensions (WxDxH) 23,5” x 33.5" x 48.4" {inciuding ADF)
Weight <657 Ibs.
Copier Features:

Auto Paper Selection, Auto Reduce/Enlarge, Auto Start, Auto Tray
Switching, Aulo Image Density, Duplex, User Codes, Stapling,
Color Erase/Convert, Hectronic Sort, Image Retation, Rotate
Sorting, Series Copy, Doc Server, User Tools, Job Presets, Book/
Series’Combine, Insert Cover/SipSheet, Chaptering, Tabs, Color/
Image Creation, Sample Copy, Energy Saver, Image Adjustment,
Multiple Security Options

Printer Specifications {(standard)

Py Irtel Pentium - M 1.4GHz
RAM 2GB (STDAMAX)
HDD 32068 (160GB x 2) (Shared)
Standard Interfaces Ethernet (1011 G0BaseTX), USE2.0
Optional Interfaces Parallel, Wireless LAN
(EEL802.T 1a/g) Bluetooth,
Ethernet 1080 Base-T
Network Protocol TCPAR, IPX/SPX, Apple Talk
Operating Systems Windows: 20000PAista/Server

2003, Server 2008, Netware; 3.12,
3.2, 4.1, 411, 5.0, 5.1, 6, 6.5, Unix,
Sun Sefarls, HP-LX, SCO OpenSener,
RedHat Linw, 1BA AX. MAC: GS 8.6
- 9.2%, 05 X 181 or [ater

Print Drivers PCLSc, PCLG, XPS {standard},
Adobe P53 {optional)
Max Print Resolution Up to 1200 dpi

Scanner Specifications
Scanning Resolution Up to 600 dpi

Scan Area Upto 117 x 177

Scan Speed Simplex BAV 82 ipm/Duplex BAW 125
iprey; Simplex Celor 70 ipm/Duplex
Color 115 ipm

Compressicn BW/Binary - TIFF MHAMRMMR

Fult Color/Grayscale: JIPEG

Standard Interfaces 10/1008a5eTH, Wireless LAN

www. ricoh-usa.com
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Scanner Features:

BWIFC Photo, BWIFC Text, Auto Color, Auto Density, Image Rotation,
Mived Size, SADF, Batch. Scan-to Modes Supported: Scan-to-Emad,
Scan-toFokder, Scen-ta-URL, TWARY Scanning, US8/5D2.0 Scan-ta

Document Server Specifications (Standard}
Max. Stored Documents 3,000

B4ax. Pages per Document 3,000

Max. Stored Pages 15,000

Fax Specifications (Optional}

Cireult PSTN, PBX
Compatibility ITLT {CCITH 63, Additonal G3 opt.
Resolution 206 x 1007260 dpi (400 dpl wsopt,
SAF memory.
Compression Method MH, MR, MMR, JBIG
Scanning Speed 0.7 sec
Modem Speed 33.6 K - 2,400 bps
Transmission Speed G3: Approx 2 sec.
Memory Sackup t hour
QuidkSpeed Dials 2,000 numbers
Group Dials 100 groups (500 per group)
Energy Saver Standard
Accessories
RT4000 DLT/ALCT
Paper Capacity 2,000 sheets
Paper Size upto 127 x 187
Paper Weight 14 1. - 1101b. Cover (300 g/rr)
Siza 38.17 x 287 x 29.3"
Weight 192 lbs.
RT43/LCT
Paper Capacity 4,600 sheets
Paper Size 85 x (17
Paper Welght 141b, - 34 Ib. Bond (128 g/m?)
Siza 12" x 18" x 267
Weight 41 s,
£5391 9-Bin Mailbox
Number of Bins 9
Stack Capacity of Bins 100 sheets
Paper Size 55 x &5 - 117 x i7"
Paper Welght 1470, - 34 Ib. Bond (128 ¢/m?)
Size 21" 224" % 26"
Weight 33 fbs,
2 Source Cover Interposer
Paper Size 557 %B5"-12"x18"
Paper Weight 47 B, Bond -~ 110 &, Index {199 o/m?)
Size 28" x 29" x 50"
Weight 52 ibs.
SR5008 103-Sheet Staple Finishert®
Capatity (Proof Tray) 500 sheets [8.5" % 11 or smatler)
250 sheets (8.57 x 14" or larger)
Paper Size 5.5" % 8.5 - 12" x 18"
Capacity ($hift Tray} 857 % 117 - 3,000 sheets
© 85" % 14" - 11" x 17" - 1,500 sheets
12" x 18" - 1,000 sheets
Paper Welght 14 Io. Bond - §10 o, Cover (300 ¢/m?)
Staple 857 x i1 . 100 pages
857 x 147 - 117 x 177 - 50 pages
Size 31" %297 x39°
Weight 165 Ibs.

*4+SRS000 must Ind.xde Finisher Adzpter Type €.
SR4030 50-Sheet Staple Finisher

Capacity (Proof Tray) 250 sheets {8.57 % 117 or smaller)
50 sheets (8,57 x 14" or larger}
Paper Size 557 x857-12"x 187
Capacity ($hift Tray) 85" % 11" - 3,000 sheets
85" x 14° - 117 x 17* - $,500 sheets
Paper Weight 14 B, Bond - $10 Ih, Cover (300 g/md)
Stagle 8.57 % 117 - 50 pages
8.5% % 14" - 117 x 17" - 30 pages
Size 267 % 24" x 38"
Weight 119755,
SRA040 Booklet Maker
Capatity (Proof Tray) 250 sheets (8.5 % 117 or smafler)
50 sheels {8.57 x 14" ar larger)
Paper Size 557 x857-12"x 18"
Capacity (Shift Tray) 85" x 11" - 2,000 sheets
85" x 147 - 117 ¥ 17" - 1,000 sheets
Paper Welght 14 bo. Bond - 110 . Cover (300 g/m?)
Staple 8.5 % 11" - 50 pages

8.57 x 147 - 117 x 177 « 30 pages

Ricah Amarieas Coparation, Five Dedick Flace, West Caldnel, NI 07005
Frohs 2 tha Kooh Loga e regvered toderaks of Picch Cormpany, 1L Al odier

tradermeds are the proparty of Ut Fespattie ooners Fricaspeed may be affecrad by
[res) retrork, appleedan of BC parforance. Spedfitations and evtarrad sppezrances are
ket iy charcs widax natice. Froducts e shaunwi opfondl feebres.

Saddle Stitch Staplets*
Size
Weight

8.5%x 117 - 12" x 18" - 15 pages
26" x 24" x 38"

£39 Ibs,

**3paner weight for sadd'e stitch stapting is 28 b, Bond max.

FD5000 Multl-Foldlng Unit

Compatible with SR5000 and $R4040 only.

Folding Type:

Single Sheet Mode: Z-Fold, Half-Fold/Print inside, Half-Fold/Print
outside, Letter Foldin/Pant inside, Letter Fold-in/Print outside,
Letter Fold-out, Double ParafielPrint inside, Bouble ParallelPrint
oulside, Gate-Fold/Print inside, Gate-Fold/Frint oulsida.

Multigle Sheets Mode: same a5 Single Sheet rmode; up to 3 sheets.
Paper Size:

single Sheet Mode: Z foldng: 8.5% x 117 - 127 x 187, Half folding:
85" x 117 Lelter folding: 8.57 x 117 - 12" x 187; Double Parallel/
Gate folding: 85" x 117 - 12* x 187; Multple Sheets Mede: Half
Tolding; 8.5 x 117 - 12" x 187; Letter foldng: 8.57 x 117; Dovble
Parallel/fGate folding: 8.57 % 117 - 12" x 18"

GBC StreamPunch Iif

Paper Size 85" x 117 LEF
Paper Weight 20 I, Bond - $10 Ib. Index (216 g/m?)
Die Sets CombBind®, Twin Loop Wire {2:1 or

3:1), ColerCol®, VeloBing®, Three-
Ring, PraClick®

BK5010e Praduction Booklet Maker

Paper Size 85" x 117 - 11" x 17"

Papar Weight 16 1. Bond - 11070, Endex (216 g/mi)
Ring Binder RB5000

Paper Sizes Supported  8.57 x 11~ (LEF only)

Max, Binding Cepacity 160 sheetsbooldet

Ring Sizes Supported 50-sheet/100-sheel

Paper Welght Punched 17 1h. Bond - 80 T Cover (216 o/m?)
Paper Weight Bound 17 l. Bord - 80 fo Cover {216 ¢/m%

34257 x 287" x 38.5°
TT18Y, S0/60Hz
3196 Ibs,

Dimensions (WxDxH)
Power Requirements
Weight

Additicnal Accessories

Single Source Cover Interposer Type 3260; Puncht Unit for SRS000;
Punch Unit for SR4030/4040; Jogger Option for 4030/404¢; Legal
Tray for RT43 LCT Type 1075; 117 x 177 Tray Type 2105; Copy
Connactor Kit Type 3260; Tab Sheet Unit Type 3260; e Format
Conwverter Type E; HDD Cvervrite Security Kit Type H; HDD
Encryption Unit Type A; Copy Data Security Kit Type F; Adebe
PostSaript3 Type £7501; [EEES02,11a/s Type J; IEEE1284 Tipe A;
Bluetcoth Interface Unit Typa 3245; Browser Unit Tipe £; G3
Intesface Kit Type 7500, Key Counter Bradcet Type 1027; Reader
Key Card Bracket Type B; Key Card IF Unit Type A; Gigabit Fthernet
Type B; Copy Tray Type 2075; FAX Memary Unit Type B 32M8,
USB2.0/50 St Type D

Fiery E-7200 Specifications

Conteoller Type Ernbedded Type
Fiery Platform Fiery E20
Maximum Continuous MP CBS015P; 65 ppm BAY, €0 pprn color

Print Speed MP C75015P; 75 ppm BAY, 70 ppm colof
CcpPU Intel Cora Duo T2500 2.0GHz
Host Interface 1000/1001 0BASE-T
Memory 1GB
laternal HDD 80GB
Operating System Uintre

TCPAP (PvAAPVE), AppleTalk (Auto
switching), $MB
Printer Description Language Adobe PosiSoipt 3, PCLG/SC

Netviork Protocol

Max Print Resolution Up to 1260 dpi

Max Scan Resalution Up to 600 dpi

Fonts P53; 138 fonts/ACL: 80 AGFA fonts

Operation Panel QOn MFP

Utilitles Standard: ComgmandWorkStation 5,
Color Wise Pro Tools, Fiery Scar,

Printer Delete Uthity, flery Web Tools
Optional: SeeQuence kmpose, Color
Profder Suite (U varsion), Auto
Trapping, Spot-On, Hot Folders

ICC Profile, Color Chart, CMYK
Color Reference Pages, RGB Color
Tests, Trapping Support, ColorWise
Pra Tools

Color Cal, Densitometer,
Spectrophatometer

For madmum performance and yield, we recommend using genuine Ricoh
parts and suppes.

Color Managemeant Tools

Calibration
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